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Patients with Myalgic Encephalomyelitis (M.E.) have a variety 
of specific care needs, some of which are well-known and 
common to a variety of other illnesses and others which are 

unique to M.E. and with which hospital staff or carers may be wholly unfamiliar.  
 
Inappropriate care (even if well intentioned) can have serious consequences for M.E. 
patients in the short term and the long term, or even permanently. Knowledge of 
some of the basics about how M.E. affects the body is vital if you are in the position 
of providing care for someone with M.E. in order to avoid additional unnecessary 
suffering and disability. This paper provides a brief overview of this topic for hospital 
staff, carers or family members. 
 
 
What is Myalgic Encephalomyelitis? How does it affect the body? 
 
M.E. is a debilitating neurological (CNS) disease which has been recognised by the 
World Health Organisation since 1969 as a distinct organic neurological disorder. It 
can occur in both epidemic and sporadic forms and over 60 outbreaks of M.E. have 
been recorded worldwide since 1934.  
 
M.E. is an acute onset neurological disease initiated by a virus (an enterovirus) with 
multi system involvement which is characterised by post encephalitic damage to the 
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number of significant ways to diseases such as Multiple Sclerosis (M.S.), Lupus and 
Polio. M.E. can be extremely disabling; at least 30% of M.E. sufferers are severely 
affected and are almost completely (or completely) housebound and/or bedbound. 
Children as young as five can get M.E., as well as adults of all ages. M.E. has a 
similar strike-rate to M.S. and is a (potentially fatal) chronic/lifelong illness. 
 
M.E. is primarily neurological, but because the brain controls all vital bodily 
functions, virtually every bodily system can be affected by M.E. Although M.E. is 
primarily neurological it is also known that the vascular and cardiac dysfunctions 
seen in M.E. are the cause of many of the symptoms and much of the disability 
associated with M.E., and that the well-documented mitochondrial abnormalities 
present in M.E. significantly contribute to both of these pathologies. There is also 
multi-system involvement of cardiac and skeletal muscle, liver, lymphoid and 
endocrine organs in M.E.  


